
bringing people together, opening up new perspectives, 
getting people to encounter new pressures and possibili­
ties. Each opposition group would continue to do its own 
thing; but they would try to find ways of understanding one 
another and working together. 

A final conference resolution — passed unanimously — 
included the agreement to meet again in six months time, 
to review progress. In the meantime participants from each 
of the major regions are to pursue the thrust of the Confer­
ence at their own local level. 

Robin Cohen, ENDGAME IN SOUTH AFRICA?, 
London, James Currey and Paris, UNESCO Press, 
1986, 108 pp. Price £4,95. 

Robin Cohen is a former South African now living in 
Coventry, where he is Director of the Centre for Ethnic 
Relations and Professor of Sociology at Warwick Uni­
versity. He completed this slim volume on the character of 
apartheid in late 1985 when South Africa was rediscover­
ing the experience of living under a formally declared state 
of emergency. His study is one of three evidently commis­
sioned by UNESCO. In addition to Cohen's book, we can 
savour the prospect of seeing the South African state 
subjected to Harold Wolpe's scrutiny, and the role of 
Pretoria's military to Abdul Minty's. 

Robin Cohen limited himself to considering the demo-
graphical and geographical manifestations of apartheid. 
Not again, you say to yourself. How many more trees have 
to be felled for paper before such a well-worn topic is finally 
laid to rest? Well, the modest sapling necessary for 
Cohen's cause is a worthwhile sacrifice. He set himself a 
fascinating exercise. First of all, what are the defining 
characteristics of apartheid in South African society? 
What, in other words, makes apartheid apartheid? Then, 
secondly, if South Africa's current rulers fell from grace 
somehow and were replaced by a regime determined to 
dismantle apartheid, how successfully could this be done? 
Would any vestiges of apartheid survive in a post-apartheid 
order? And, if so, which elements would prove intractable? 
In attempting to respond to the second set of questions at 
the moment, the social scientist is forced to indulge in 
speculation, as Cohen acknowledges. Still, speculation, if 
informed and prudent, can aid our understanding of the 
likely turn of events in a society's course. With that in mind, 
let's reflect on the argument advanced by Cohen. 

(Reprinted with the permission of The Natal Witness.) 

P.S. — This article was written shortly before the formation 
of the NDM (the National Democratic Movement). 

In several centres mini-conferences, based on the Five 
Freedoms National Conference, will take place before 
long.D 

Reviewed by Ralph Lawrence 

A LEAP OF FAITH 

We begin with a leap of faith. The scholarly weight of 
Endgame in South Africa? is founded on two telling 
assumptions. Reject either of them and the edifice they are 
upholding will collapse. The one assumption can be ex­
pressed simply: white minority rule will be replaced by 
black majority rule. The transformation is inevitable, but 
how and when it will come about are beyond our ken. It's 
quite an assumption, isn't it? I want to dwell on this a little, 
for I believe it is yet a.further illustration of what I call "the 
rationalist fallacy", so prevalent among observers of the 
South African scene who would dearly love apartheid to 
end. The fallacy takes various forms. I cannot specify them 
all here; a few representative cases will have to suffice. The 
moral exemplar is the most frequently stated. Good will 
eventually triumph over evil: apartheid is inherently unjust, 
an affront to human dignity, an anathema to contemporary 
societies the world over; therefore its demise is assured. 
Alternatively, apartheid is viewed as irredeemably contra­
dictory. By such reckoning, the economic imperatives and 
the political imperatives of apartheid are incompatible; thus 
apartheid contains the seeds of its own destruction. Lastly, 
apartheid is anomalous: a minority cannot hold out per­
petually against the majority, especially when the very 
existence of a ruling racial elite runs counter to the trend 
whereby colonial governments, notably in Africa, have 
handed over the keys of state to their erstwhile subjects. Of 
course apartheid is immoral, illogical and anomalous. Yet 
any or all of these judgements, of themselves, cannot be 
regarded as infallible predictions of apartheid's fate. The 
fact is that South Africa's future is inevitably uncertain. 

THE LEGACY OF APARTHEID 
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umbrella of the new Conservative Party. The Conserva­
tives have turned out to be not only a substantial electoral 
force, especially in the Transvaal, but also a countervailing 
power, making the government's attitude to the dismant­
ling of racial barriers ever more circumspect. At the other 
end of the political spectrum, the United Democratic Front 
arose as a vehicle to give organised opposition to the birth 
of the Tricameral Parliament. Extra-parliamentary opposi­
tion has been a painful thorn in the government's flesh 
from that moment on. Parliament's emasculated role in 
attending to the affairs of state has lessened faith in that 
institution, prompting many citizens to transfer their efforts 
to the extra-parliamentary arena instead. Moreover, the 
trade union movement has grown rapidly in recent years 
since the government lifted restrictions, thus permitting 
black workers to be organised more or less free from direct 
state control. In December 1985, greater impetus and 
cohesion was given to the labour movement when an over­
arching body, the Congress of South African Trade Unions, 
was launched. These days COSATU is a major actor on 
the political scene outside parliament, often working in 
conjunction with the UDF to bring pressure to bear on the 
organs of apartheid rule. 

This brief survey of noteworthy developments in contem­
porary South Africa would not be complete without some 
mention of the economy. Malaise is evident: foreign 
debt; divestment, disinvestment and sanctions carried 
out by companies abroad and trading partners; inflation, 
unemployment and recession at home. And add to this the 
crippling burden of the military's budgetary requirements. 
Add further the costs of drought and floods experienced in 
the 1980s. Hardly an edifying balance-sheet. What's most 
dismaying of all is the impression I have that those who are 
worst placed in the economy are really floundering. Who 
are affected most severely by the ravages of floods and 
drought? Where does unemployment strike hardest? Who 
feels increased prices of essential goods most keenly? I 
leave you to conclude the obvious. At the opposite end of 
the scale, those in sheltered employment, typically in the 
government service, and those who are associated with 
corporations that are able to impose their will on the 
market, barely notice any adjustment to their personal wel­
fare caused by misfortunes in the South African economy. 

It should be patently clear, I trust, from the items I have just 
enumerated that the course of events in South Africa's 
immediate past is exceedingly complex. In order to chart 
the fate of apartheid, one would have to explore all of these 
so as to discern the trends and tendencies at work. And yet 
even after completing so exhaustive, and exhausting, an 
analysis, no guarantees can be attached to the conclu­
sions reached. But to revert to Cohen's study. What are his 
findings? 

APARTHEID AND RADICAL CHANGE 

What elements of apartheid, supposing there are any, will 
prove most impervious to radical change in South African 
society? To address this issue, Cohen maintains, one has 
to have some idea of what a post-apartheid order will be 
like. Cohen hazards a guess, based on a series of assump­
tions, all of which he believes are eminently plausible. 
Violence and economic crisis will beset South Africa, 
causing the downfall of the present regime and, in the long-
term, ushering in black majority government, although 
some other bargained compromise may come earlier as 
the initial move away from apartheid proper. The ultimate 

victors will be proponents of the Freedom Charter, a 
political party combining many, though not all, ANC and 
UDF sympathisers. To give it a name, Cohen invents the 
United National African Party, the UNAP. On gaining hold 
of the reins of power, a UNAP government will pursue a 
foreign policy akin to Mugabe's Zimbabwe: the Eastern 
bloc will not be shunned, South Africa will join the Non-
Aligned Movement and will seek re-entry to the Common­
wealth. Trade, foreign investment and aid will all be sought 
on a pragmatic basis. Power will be wielded by a black 
bourgeoisie by virtue of the monopoly it acquires over the 
state apparatus. This, then, is the scenario. If it came 
to pass — quite an assumption, after all, for which no 
concerted argument is offered — would apartheid dis­
appear overnight? No. Let's discover why. 

The real strength in Cohen's book is the way he manages 
to reduce apartheid to its fundamental elements, each 
having a form of ideology associated with it. Apartheid, 
says Cohen, comprises four pillars. Three of these he dis­
cusses in detail, revealing how they have altered with the 
passage of time. Though not as fulsome as Alf Stadler's 
The Political Economy of Modern South Africa, Co­
hen's account is stylish, erudite and succinct. All credit to 
him for embarking on so ambitious an analysis, even 
though it fails to accomplish all that it was designed to do. 

FOUR PILLARS 

The first pillar of apartheid is white minority rule itself. When 
apartheid goes, this will go too. Presumably a universal 
franchise will be adopted, although Cohen omits to say so 
explicitly. At any rate, a unicameral legislative assembly at 
the national level will come into being. Conceivably, partici­
pation by whites, coloureds and Indians might be assured 
for a specified period. Local government will be a crucial 
organ of representation, allowing communities to have 
their urgent needs dealt with by officials with whom they 
would be in close contact. Cohen maintains, however, that 
once the novelty of participation has worn off, blacks will 
lose interest in government and whites will carry a dispro­
portionate weight in relation to their numbers. It's an inter­
esting assertion, contentious but not unreasonable, which 
merits extended treatment. Cohen, however, is content 
just to make the point. 

Apartheid's second pillar is the attempt to create and to 
harmonise racial categories and territorial boundaries. 
Here apartheid will linger after the UNAP comes to power. 
Although the Group Areas Act will be expunged from the 
statute book, communities will not become transformed as 
an immediate consequence. The market for land and hous­
ing will impose imperatives, and areas will come to reflect 
their character according to class rather than race. The 
homelands, notionally independent or otherwise, will be 
problematic. Cohen seems to imagine that they might 
continue as distinct entities, given some autonomy but 
linked somehow to the central government. Shades of the 
princely states in colonial India? 

Regulation and control of the labour supply is the third pillar 
of apartheid. Freedom of movement and freedom to seek 
employment will prevail under a UNAP government. But a 
system of incentives will have to be introduced to direct 
labour to where it is required. The agricultural sector will 
remain dependent on the commercial farms owned by 
whites. A continuing supply of labour to these enterprises 
will have to be guaranteed. Likewise, workers will have to 
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be enticed to the gold mines, for the economy could not 
survive without the sale of the metal on the world market. 

Finally, apartheid's fourth pillar is the ability of the regime to 
keep social control, to restore stability whenever the need 
arises. In fact, any government is charged with this respon­
sibility. Given South Africa's turbulent past and present, 
Cohen remarks, violence is unlikely to come to a halt 
as soon as apartheid is formally abolished. Truculent, 
unrepentant whites might resist the new order, as might 
conservative blacks deeply hostile to a UNAP government. 
Appropriate steps will have to be taken by those in power. 
They may have to deal, in addition, with angry, frustrated, 
black youths when economic rewards do not match their 
expectations. And how will the government of the day 
view squatters amassing in the urban areas in search of 
education, employment and similar services? Order will be 
a major priority for a UNAP administration; and in pursuing 
it liberal values may well go by the board. 

The general picture Cohen paints is familiar enough: in a 
word, Zimbabwe. The trade is a simple one. In return for 
relinquishing political power to the presently disen­
franchised black majority, whites will be able to retain 
substantial economic power and privilege. No government, 
unless bent on economic, hence political, suicide could 
contemplate replacing the captains of industry with 
idealistic recruits. As Cohen argues, the nightmarish com­
parison white South Africans frequently draw with other 
African countries is both misleading and unnecessary. The 
Republic's mineral wealth and strategic location keep her 
in the reckoning of the global community. In South Africa 
there is sufficient skilled personnel and resources to allow 
further industrial development. All in all a reassuring vision, 
except to the residents of Soutpansberg, no doubt. 

In my view, there are too many unexplained assumptions in 

Cohen's argument to make it thoroughly compelling and 
convincing. If only there had been fewer assertions and 
more evidence. Nevertheless, there is much to commend 
in his book. Above all, I enjoyed the spirit of his enterprise. 
It's vitally important for we South Africans to eschew 
wishful thinking. There is nothing more dangerous and 
counterproductive in politics than false expectations. The 
abolition of apartheid rule will not transform South Africa 
into heaven on earth, and it's as well to realise that. But, by 
the same token, infernal hell need not be visited on us 
either. In trying to calculate what a post-apartheid South 
Africa might look like, Cohen does us all a service. Debate 
and discussion about the future of this country can usefully 
be centred on a set of proposals, and these Cohen gives 
us. 

A closing thought. Societies under siege, under threat, 
tend to become intensely inward-looking and parochial. 
Such is the situation in South Africa; it has been so for quite 
some time. But \n order fully to comprhend our society and 
to gauge what lies ahead, we have to pay attention not only 
to the peculiarities of South Africa, but also to what is 
transpiring in comparable countries. Cohen mentions the 
post-colonial societies of South-East Asia. Ower the last 
few years I have come to believe there is much to be gained 
by trying to discern the character of what I call advanced 
Third World societies. South Africa belongs in such a 
category, I suggest, together with Nigeria, India, Argentina, 
Brazil and, maybe, Indonesia. Whilst not embarking on 
quite such a voyage of discovery, Cohen does expose the 
reader's thoughts to such a possibility, which is indeed 
welcome. For this reason too, then, apart from the others I 
have alluded to elsewhere, Endgame in South Africa? is 
an unusually timely and relevant contribution to the under­
standing of our troubled society.• 
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