
Brother of union organiser killed by police 
ON Monday March 18, seven* 
t e e n - y e a r - o l d Z f t m e k i l e 
Magugu went a round to a 
house in the Uitenhgge town* 
ship of Kwanobuhle to pay his 
respects to a family whose son 
had been shot dead by police. 

Hours later, he too was dead. 
His body, riddled with police 
bullets, was left lying in the 
street 

Since the beginning of the 
year, scores of young people 
have tragically died in similar 
circumstances in the Uitenhage 
townsh ips . And i t is s t i l l 
continuing. 

National Union of Textile 
Workers organiser, Freddie 
Magugu. told FOSATU Worker 
News of the evonts that led to 
his younger brother's death. 

'My brother, together with 
other friends of the family, had 
gathered that morning at the 
house in Kwanobuhle for a 
prayer meeting/ 

'The dead son was one of 
those who were to be buried on 
March 2 1 / he said. 

'While they were in the 
house, the police came in two 
Caspirs* One parked outside 
the house and flred tear gas 

into the lounge/ 
'Everybody ran out of the 

house to get away from the tear 
gas/ he added. 

*My brother ran into the next 
door yard, to the back and 
jumped over the fence/ 

The other Caspir was parked 
there and it was from tha t 
Caspir that he was shot/ Broth* 
er Magugu said. 

'The police fired a number of 
shots so my brother jumped 
over another fence and ran to^ 
wards the church, It was while 
he was running that he was hit 
by one of the bullets.' 

'He tried to get over the fence 
of the church. They shot him 
again/ 

*He tried to get up and run 
behind a wall. The police shot 
again/ 

'Another guy who had fol­
lowed my brother said tha t 
after the police had checked he 
was dead, they shook hands 
and laughed/ 

The police left his body there 
and then went back to the 
house where they arrested ev­
erybody who was at the prayer 
meeting/ Brother Magugu said* 
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