
Pensions! 
rHE issue of pensions has reared 
its head again following the 
jetting up of a select committee 
lo look once more at the pres­
ervation of pensions. 

Already, it has led to a strike 
it a Pinetown paint factory and 
unions report that workers arc 
3ncc 3gain expressing cone* 
ern about their pensions. 

Three years ago, the infamous 
Pensions Preservation Bill which 
threatened lo 'freeze" workers* 
pensions set off a wave of strikes 
throughout the country. 

More than 20 000 workers 
at over 40 factories stopped 
work in support of demands for 
the withdrawal of their pension 
money. 

As a result of this wide-spread 
worker protest, the government 
withdrew the Bill, 

But recently it has announced 
the setting up of a select comm* 
ittee which among other things 
will look again at the issue of 
pension preservation. 

In direct response to this 
announcement, workers at Berg-
er Paints demanded to speak to 
management about their pen­
sions. 

A Chemical Workers Industrial 
Union organiser said manage­
ment had initially responded by 
saying that workers did not 
really understand pensions. 

They suggested that officials 
from the fund come to the fact­
ory to explain to workers how 
the fund operates, he said. 

On hearing this, workers 
stopped work and only agreed 
to go back when the company 
agreed to negotiate the terms 
of Berger*s pension fund with 
the union. 

It is clear that the freezing**of 
pensions has been rejected by 
workers and FOSATU hopes 
that this time the government 
will consult with workers' rep­
resentatives before taking any 
steps towards introducing a new 
pension bill 


