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'Grasp the nettle' 
ACERTIFICATE pinned to a board in 

her secretary's office describes 
Mamphela Ramphele, Deputy Vice-

Chancellor of Ihe University of Cape Town, 
as recipient of an "impossible is not a word 
in my vocabulary" award. That's how her 
colleagues in UCTs Equal Opportunity unit 
like to tease her but it also captures some­
thing essential about her attitude. 

So she's optimistic about "the situation in 
the country" - the matter to which South 
Africans gravitate obsessively in encounters 
of any length - the subject we have circled 
for half an hour while she sketched a devel­
opment strategy for the youth. 

"I'm saying that we are on the right track, 
that in the long term we're going to reach the 
end ol the road, if we keep our heads cool 
and have the political will to act" she says as 
she slices up an apple with a Swiss army 
knife (this is lunch, snatched in five minutes 
ot chat between wall-to-wall appoint men Is), 

'Boys on the border and boys 

in the township, it's alt the 

same thing' 

It's a phrase she uses a lew times - "politi­
cal will" - something she believes exists in 
sufficient measure to save South Africans 
from their nightmares. ''Even Kriel can rise 
above his own mess and stop posturing/' 
she says. "Even Apia can rise beyond its 
own mess* I can tell you, the problem is not 
on one side - if s everywhere." 

The same breezy confidence informs her 
approach to the problems of Ihe "lost gener­
ation". "I don't think we should even talk 
about 'lost', you know," says Ramphele. 
"When you talk 'lost', you've given up and I 
don't think there is anything that indicates lo 
me that I should give up on any section of 
our society, let alone young people." 

"I think what is important is to move 
away from looking at the problem as a prob­
lem of young people. If s a societal problem. 
We have failed lo nurture young people. 

"But we've gone further than that; we 
have acquiesced - in some cases actively 
engaged them in fighting our wars because 
we were too much of cowards as adults to 
do Ihe fighting ourselves. By that I mean 
both black and while kids - boys on the bor­
der and boys in the townships, it's all the 
same thing. 

A national youth development pro­
gramme must be seen as an essen­
tial part of national reconstruction, 
says UCT luminary Mamphela 
Ramphele. Otherwise everything 
else wi l l go up in smoke. She 
spoke to SHAUNA WESTCOTT. 

"1 think that we are being challenged by 
what is going on in terms of young people in 
this country to take cognisance of the history 
that lias brought us to where we are But we 
are also being challenged lo develop creative 
approaches to the problems that we face. 

"Young people actually are, I think, a synv 
bol, a metaphor of what we have neglected 
in ourselves as a people. We have neglected 
baste services, or basic needs provision for 
people. By that I mean basic housing, basic 
education, basic health, basic issues of sim­
ple nutrition. If we were a society that pro­
vided adequately for those things we would 
hardly be landed where we are," 

Ramphele is "very encouraged" by the 
launch of the National Youth Development 
Forum in September. This is what the coun­
try needs, what the youth needs - she ticks 
oft points on a mental checklist - the "ele-
menls ol a viable national vouth develop­
ment programme". 

First, she says, it needs to be recognised 
that there are some young people who can-
nol be forced back into the formal schooling 
system. 

"They've got out ol the simple habit of sit­
ting behind a desk and no convincing or 
ca|oling will get them back there. On the 
contrary, if you force them back into the 
school system, they will be disruptive of the 
whole process for the other kids. 

"So we need to find a creative non-school-
based programme of education to take care 
of those young people, and I would hope 
that politicians grasp the nettle and some 
announcement is made soon that children of 
18 years and above should not be registered 
in the school system unless they are doing 
their tnatric or Std 9 and they have done well 
enough to actually have the prospeel of com-
pleting schooling in the next two years/' 

Secondly, says Ramphele, there has to be 
public recognition and acceptance of the fad 
that many teachers, particularly Department 
of Education and Training tDET) teachers, 
are "simplv not skilled to teach". Further, 

that these teachers are demoralised, because 
they know they are not capable of teaching 
and yel are expected to teach. 

"So what thev have now done is wrhat kids 
were challenging them to do in the 1970s 
and 1980s, which is to come out on th? 
streets and toyi-toyl Now the kids want to 
learn, the teachers are catching up with ihe 
toyi-toyi rather late in the day. 

"Again, we need firm political leadership, 
someone has to say: right, you want lu 
remain in the teaching system, you have tn 
be party to the provision of high-quality 
education. Resourcing education in such 
terms as new schools and better equipment 
will come lo nought unless you also deal 
directly with this problem of teachers who 
are not really properly equipped to teach. 

"We need a vigorous in-service training 
programme, which is not about giving peo­
ple certificates but a real process aimed at 
helping teachers to provide high-quality 
education. Tlus would involve bolh teachers 
and students changing their attitudes and 
creating a different environment in the class­
room. Teachers who are not prepared to be 

Ramphele call 
part of this should not be allowed to con* 
tinue to teach/' 

Whether this reform of the education sys-
lem happens or not will depend on - yes. 
political will, Someone has to "grasp the net­
tle" - another phrase of the moment -
because: "There are some teachers who are 
beyond it now - alcoholics, there are many 
alcoholics in the DET system, people who 
run private businesses while teaching - ihe 
whole system is corrupt. Somebody has to 
grasp the nettle and dean it up. There has to 
be greater accountability* Otherwise we will 
continue to produce the kids who land up on 
Ihe streets." 

The third element of the programme "has 
to be about developing a skill development 
process which is tied up with the place of 
work". Ramphele says. lamenting Ihe fact 
thai South Africa lacks the "culture of 
apprenticeship" so fruitful in countries like 
Switzerland and Germany-

She is concerned about a trend in favour 
of making technical education like university 
education, "where people end up with 
degrees and little technical knowledge". 
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or clean-up in classrooms 
'1 think we are going the wrong route if 

We follow Britain as our model, We ought to 
be following the European continent in 
lerms of revamping our technical colleges, 
our technikons, into technologically 
equipped places producing technically 
skilled people who will drive our economy; 
We don't need another type ot BA that hap­
pens to come from a trchnikon/' 

'There are many alcoholics in 
I the DET system' 

What Ramphele wants to see is "a well* 
functioning technical college system, linked 
to places of work> accommodating a lot ol 
young people in residenlially based pro­
grammes". 

"I really insist on it being residenlially 
based where feasible/' she says, "because 
pari of the current problem is the fact that 
young people live in homes which are over* 
crowded, where they have no space, and 
tobody really has time to listen to them, and 
therefore Ihev have very little opportunity to 

develop into well-rounded human beings, 
"The old boarding school lype of 

approach had its drawbacks but one thing it 
did do was to introduce young people to Ihe 
life of routine, the life of order, Ihe life of 
accountability, Ihe life of understanding that 
there are certain rules and regulations that 
govern behaviour II you live in a family of 
17 people in a shack or two-roomed house -
and quite frankly it's amazing how much 
order there is in that - the fact of the matter 
is that you suffer. So. we really need to exer­
cise our minds to provide a mix of training 
opportunities, including residenlially based 
opportunities*" 

Ramphele believes that this kind of work* 
place-linked approach to education and 
training will be of some help to (he 52 per­
cent of South African youth who are unem­
ployed - three million young people 
between the ages of 16 and 30. 

"We've got to train young people with an 
eye lo them getting employed, either in the 
concerns where they have trained or in 
enterprises that Ihey form as groups - small 
business development enterprises, One of 

THIS PAGE SPONSORED BY AECI LTD 

the big problem* in this country is that we're 
very good at producing fob seekers but not 
at producing job creators/' she savs. 

"I would imagine that one of the major 
thrusts of this National Youlh Development 
Forum has to be about enabling young peo­
ple not only to get work but to create work. 
But we need also to by looking at public 
works programmes to mop up this 52 per­
cent you're talking about. 

"I'm not talking about digging trenches 
only, although there's nothing wrong with 
digging trenches. I'm talking about planting 
forests, for instance, doing all sorts of things 
which are vital for our economy and for our 
ecology. There are many things, 1 mean you 
look at the backlogs in housing, look at the 
backlogs in Ihe provision of facilities, com­
munal facilities, and soon, I think young 
people could be used in this as well 

7 / you have a career ahead of 
you, you don't take risks' 

"Then there's also the issue ot literacy. We 
have a 60 percent illiteracy rate in this coun­
try. In countries like Cuba they used voung 
people during school holidays or as part of 
their national service lo teach literacy. We 
could also be thinking creatively about this 
as part of a public works programme/' 

Youthful ignorance about sexuality - and 
the resultant high incidence of both teenage 
pregnancy and sexually transmitted diseases 
- is another area that must receive attention, 

"We have to talk about sexuality in the 
school system, in the workplace, in religious 
groups, and so on. But ultimately* 1 believe il 
young people are on a path which gives 
them hope, they have no time to have babies. 

"You know, they have babies because they 
need something to cuddle, something they 
think will make them be taken seriously. It 
may be very infantile in formulation but the 
fact of the matter is that subconsciously 
that's what happens. If you have a career 
ahead of you, you don't take risks, whether 
they be in terms of teenage pregnancy, or 
AIDS or anything else/' 

Asked to comment on the assertion that 
unless population growth is reduced, no 
amount of sound, good, progressive pro­
grammes will help South Africa, Ramphele 
says she would agree but, she adds with a 
note of asperity; "The fad of the matter is 
that you don't reduce population growth by 
sterilising people. You reduce population 
growth by improving their socio-economic 
circumstances. Then they can't afford to 
have babies/' 


