
Another Black Eye 
GJOUTH AFRICANS should be under no illusions 

about the impact the jail-without-trial Bill will 
make in London and Washington. (Its reception in 
the capitals of most of the Afro-Asian nations is 
not of significance: many of them live in glass 
houses and cannot afford to throw stones anyway.) 
The break with Western tradition and standards 
which the measure signifies cannot be explained 
away satisfactorily to people to whom habeas cor­
pus, the cornerstone of individual liberty, is a 
sacred principle whose violation is never justified 
except in the midst of war. 

South Africa's representatives abroad have al­
ways been able to make out a case of sorts for 
the policy of apartheid or separate development 
But there is no case to be made for the more out­
rageous provisions in the Vorster Bill; and those 
voices periodically raised in this country's defence 
overseas by well-disposed Britons and Americans, 
will be stilled on this issue. 

In other words the Republic's already bruised 
image will, we fear, collect another black eye. 

To the extent that all this aggravates this coun­
try's isolation and embarrasses those in the 
Western world anxious to be our friends and to 
defend us from unfair attacks, this Bill cannot be 
too strongly condemned. South Africa is putting 
itself outside the pale of free-world standards, 
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